National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122" Meeting held on 11-12-2019

TS SR STt AT (QTHTHE) B 122 & Yoo # g€l a1 drigy

(BTS 9. 1,/13 /2019—HAY)
fe=i® : 11.12.2019 9 : 03.00 g9

W GO P, TS A Sl AN, BOl dd, aedde  Wad, T8
faeeli—110003.

JeTETdT ¢ AN T FAR WY, FAAIG T |
gl &1 3=

1. of ACHAR A, A IeTE

2. N ERGWT TER, AFY AT

3. 4 gEgWIE gelerel awTd], A Rl
4. & va g, wfia

5. @, THAN, FIaa Al

6. ©f. ifera oreer, e

7. 8 TadiAE, wEs e

8. A TBY FAR g4, WERISD e (F2me)
9. # YOIR FAR, Ve MRS (IISTHT)
10. S 1S % 9, YT IMEADRI

11, 8 IR T fAsm, aR= a=wd

12. A gRRM Hom, RS avS

13. 571 . 4. g, AAEHR

Yo7 & forg PRIRE PRI weil wR ==t & ¥ SR fF=fafea fof forar g

fa



pr—r |
No.1/13/2019-Coord.
Government of India
National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Fkkkkk
8" Floor, 'B’ Wing, Lok Nayak Bhawan,
Khan Market, New Delhi -110003
Dated: 13" December, 2019
To,
Shri Nand Kumar Sai, Hon’ble Chairperson
Shri Hari Krishna Damor, Hon'ble Member
Shri Harshadbhai Chunilal Vasava, Hon’ble Member
Smt. Maya Chintamn Ivnate, Hon'ble Member

BwWN

Subject: Summary Record of discussions of 122" Meeting of National Commission for
Scheduled Tribes (NCST) held on 11.12.2019 at 3:00 P.M.

Sir/Madam,

| am directed to refer to the above subject and to say that 122" meeting of the National
Commission for Scheduled Tribes was held on 11.12.2019 at 3:00 P.M. in the Conference Room of
NCST at Lok Nayak Bhawan, New Delhi. The Meeting was presided over by Shri Nand Kumar Sai,
Hon'ble Chairperson, National Commission for Scheduled Tribes. A copy of the Summary Record of
discussions of meeting is enclosed for information and record.

Yourgyfaithfully,

(S.R M&ena)
Assistant Director

Copy for necessary action, a copy of the Summary Record of discussions of 122t meeting of NCST
is enclosed. The action taken report in the matter may be intimated to Coord. Section by 10.01.2020.

(i) Director

(i) Deputy Secretary

(i) Assistant Director (Coord&RU-II)
(iv) Assistant Director (Admin&RU-III)
(v) Assistant Director (RU-l & OL)
(vi) Research Officer (RU-IV)

Copy for information of the Summary Record of discussion of 122" Meeting of NCST:

PS to Hon’ble Chairman, NCST

PA to Hon’ble Member(HKD), NCST

PS to Hon’ble Member(HCV), NCST

PS to Hon’ble Member(MCI), NCST

Sr.PPS to Secretary, NCST

PA to Joint Secretary, NCST

Secretary, MoTA, Shastri Bhawan, New Delhi.

Director/Assistant Director/Research Officer in Regional Office of NCST at
Bhopal/Bhubaneshwar/Jaipur/ Raipur/ Ranchi/Shillong

NIC, NCST for uploading on the website.

G0 =l O gy b =

©




= o7
LEEEE]

National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122" Meeting held on 11-12-2019

P G AT | PO o0 @ 6eY § AR D GAE A ASRe JJH0e 342 B e
Ho 122.1 FfRa sl @ gt § weE Bg g dfae e

Brse |o Cabinet Note/02/MTA/2019/RU-11

FIE B wEeE ¥ SR YT W AEIS g UG SNl qe ey &
T, eUTEd USY WRGR @ fedie 10092018 @ UH W& SSIETA/WCD-

08/2017/534/183 @Y ufel @I W™ & §Y GGG P H31erd ¥ feid faear, 2018
& PRI TUT G 15025 /02 /2013—%1 U8 Tergw—1 &l T Uiy doil T8 oy amamT =
S[eTE—3TTR, 2019 TN FAT=R, 2019 ¥ SIS B1d HaATerd ¥ wr fdar |

2. SRIF gt g w® o @1 #Aed 7 daied g@e| |Wo 12016/15/2001-
TA/C&LM-1(130) fe=iies 31 araeay, 2019 @ U AT A AT amanmT &1 gioe dfe-e

dle & WY AT, 2019 BT T g3l |

3. TH Gy ¥ UE Sooid far Ol ¥ fF ART @ GUE §RT 39 US9 B Sedl @
Feeror Ug e @ forg gy Rrerd &7 ey o 2| Weu™ & IJeoT 366 @ Ws(25) H
R ST @ TR 59 YaR @1 &1 TS © B SrRyfa ST i Tt Sieporteran
T ST GHE AT AT A7 g1 R ded Wi SIHoadt a1 e 9Eg B e &
Ieeeg @) qfd B Y IgeT 342 B qEA SITHAT SIST FHSI SR |7 SIS HTaET
& AR, el faely Wow 1 WY o & @ Wy # orgqud Siota bl g fafidee
Hfrd IS AR A7 FY T 85 Pl AR W WHI B D qI¢ U & IS B
SRRTET gRT BT 8 | 39S SWRIT IfId St & gar § @ |1 wifier B a1 e
@ oy qen e WeeEl @ I Baar wue g S # HeieE @ Aead W @ fdar o
HHT B |

4. IR SO B g H | W wie R a1 Fees @ fav @S (1) @ 780 I
ST O BR WS B 9Y O g 5 SIonfa A1 S e a1 WeT @l a1
T g @ R @ A1 GHerd Bl e fhar ar e o wadr g1 Ry 99 TS b
TEd S B TS IR B AguRId fhel TRt srfergEeT g uRRafia w81 fear S |

T

1. 5= FAT FE/DR. Nand Kumar Sai
¥er/Chairperson .
e wgfe sy e
National Commussion for Scheduled Tribes
I §Y%7/Govt. of India .«
=% feh/New Delhi




National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122" Meeting held on 11-12-2019

5. fai® 25.05.2016 TAT 15.11.2016 B g2 HAFHeA @ 307 o A 3y T IgAeT o
T & URTE B IR WR e g Rt A fdum g S / SR St
ARy (S e, 2016 U fhar war R ow, BRNTe, dfierrg den BigRT @
eI SRR STl @ R § Wi wR i BRA BT URaTd Wt € |

6. PRI Uy QR ST B g F of WIF W SRAN B Ud SU S Bl
PT IS B Bl TR B Ay TG D WM @GR Se) e, 1950 H W
T B o ve e wiika fhar Tar| SR @ Uh S GG Gl BT M B b
oy AR USg WeR @ ward /eIy o ARG & "Eeie  (SIROHeE) T ISy
SR ST ST & U 17—21 /W1 # enfier o T | e SR S S
(wenem) fadges, 1950 ¥ WM @& oy AU SrEfyT SOt ey fage, 2019 & M
¥ R aiRe & @ Ry wfFsa & A @1 sy fFar T g1

7 9 Wl ¥§, U8 Soord fHAT WIar ¥ 5 fRAE 17.10.2014 BT AT ERT AU 624l
Jo& § 37 AFel W Ugd & fAER fhar S g1 @ 91 96% & WR B SN R HACd

F 3 & 93 NP/Service/Inclusion(Darlong)/ Tripura/2013/RU-Il &1 06.11.2018 &
HETH | WAl S AT @ |

(oo @ SRM T R A Tl g2, N 7 ye W rw weAfa & e g9
TR SO &1 JATed &Y giad &3 &1 Ao ferarn)

e e - ol

2f. 7% FAT E/OR. Nand Kumar Sai
=/ Chairperson
e Sl A S
Nationa! Commission for Scheduled Tribes

T 9T/ Govt. of India -
1§ Reei/New Delhi



National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122" Meeting held on 11-12-2019

Agenda Draft note for Cabinet for revision of List of Scheduled Tribes (Sts) Notified
item No.- | under Article 342 of Constitution of India with respect to the State of
122.1 Tripura.

File No. Cabinet Note/02/MTA/2019/RU-I1

Ministry of Tribal Affairs has forwarded a copy of O.M. No.15025/02/2013-C&LM-1
dated October, 2018, received in the Commission July-August, 2019 and September, 2019 from
Ministry of Tribal Affairs enclosing with a copy of letter no. SSJETA/WCD-08/2017/534/183
dated 10.09.2018 of Department Social Justice & Empowerment and Tribal Affairs, Government
of Arunachal Pradesh on the above mentioned subject.

2 Ministry of Tribal Affairs has forwarded a copy of O.M. No.12016/15/2001-TA/C&LM-
1(130) dated 315 October, 2019, received in the Commission enclosing with a copy of Draft Note
for the Cabinet dated October, 2019 on the above mentioned subject.

3. In this context, it is stated that the Constitution of India enjoins on the State a special
responsibility for the protection and development of Scheduled Tribes. Clause (25) of article 366
of the Constitution defines Scheduled Tribes as “ST means such tribes or tribal communities or
parts of or groups within such tribes or tribal community as are deemed under article 342 to be ST
for the purpose of this Constitution”. According to the above mention provisions, the first
specification of Scheduled Tribes in relation to a particular State or UT is by a notified Order of
President, after consultation with the Stage Govt. or UT concerned. Any subsequent inclusion in
or exclusion from and other modifications in list of ST can be made only through an amending
Act of Parliament.

4. Parliament may by law include in or exclude from the list of Scheduled Tribes specified in
a notification issued under clause (1) any tribe or tribal community or part of or group within any
tribe or tribal community, but save as aforesaid a notification issued under the said clause shall not
be varied by any subsequent notification.

5, The based on the approval given by the Cabinet in its meetings held on 25.5.2016 and
15.11.2016 to the proposals of the Ministry, a bill namely “ The constitution SC/ST Order
(Amendment) Bill,2016 containing proposals for inclusion and modifications in existing list of ST
of Assam, Chhattisgarh, Tamil Nadu and Tripura.

6. The proposal is for introduction of a Bill in Parliament to amend the Constitution (ST)
Order 1950 to give effect the inclusion of ‘Darlong’ as sub tribe of Kuki in entry 9 in the list of ST
of the State of Tripura. The proposal/recommendation of State Government of Tripura for
inclusion of ‘Darlong’ as sub tribe of ‘Kuki’ in the list of ST, concurrence of RGI and NCST at
page 17-21/c. Approval of the Cabinet is solicited for introduction of Bill namely, the Constitution
ST Orders (Amd.) Bill, 2019 further to amend the Constitution (ST) Order, 1950.

— €A

31, 5 FHY FE/DR. Nand Kumar Sai
Fo/Chairperson
T e S S
Nationa! Commission for Scheduled Tribes
wTa @rET/Govt. of India
=¥ Fawsti/New Delhi



National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122" Meeting held on 11-12-2019

1 In the instant case, it is mentioned that these matter has already been considered in the
Commission’s in its 62" meeting held on 17.10.2014, and the extract of the proceedings of
meeting was sent to the Ministry of Tribal Affairs vide Commission’s letter No.
NP/Service/Inclusion (Darlong)/Tripura/2013/RU-II dated 06.11.2018.

(The matter was discussed in detail during the meeting, the Commission has approved
the proposal and decided to inform the Ministry of Tribal Affairs accordingly.)

i e S s

3, F= FAW TA/OR. Nand Kumar Sai
aremd/Chairperson
e AR A
National Com 'mc 1on for Scheduled Tribes

s JeE/ Govt. of India
=% st/ New Delhi



National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122" Meeting held on 11-12-2019

B Al | SreUTH Yo T B W § ARG @ WU § AJeq 342 © qed e
T 0 FrRIfra STl (THd) @ g § waeE & g gie @fde A

1222

wrsel 60 Policy/05/2018/MTA(AP)/RU-II

SRIgd affa vy ) S=edg & 5396 7 drtad 99 |o  12026/24/2012-

C&LM-1 f&sies 31 areeaR, 2019 &1 Uiy ¥ frar & S oMM 7 gioe Bfae Ale @1 ufd
@ A faAid TaeER, 2019 B WISl g3l |

2. X7 Hey ¥, I8 Toorg a1 el & 6 WR o1 HiAE 39 o BT ST & HRE
vd i @ forg Ry Rierd 1 o a7 8 | Wi @ Jros 366 & Ws(25) ¥ ANfod
T @) GRE 3 YeR @ & TS 2 5 ergefaa Seenfa sifd T STt
SRS W AT WA A7 <g R 9gd U St a1 S WHE B e @
SeeT B Y B oy erjedT 342 B TEG ARLAT SIS FHS SR |7 SWIERT W= &
FTaR, Tl faehy vog a1 W9 ow &9 @ way H Sryfon St &1y fafidee e
TS AYBR T HE XS &5 B TRBR | R He & 918 G S QY & ARG g
BT £ | TP SWI G St B A F 7o W e s a1 e @ fog den
= Al @ oy dae wae g7 AR ¥ HeeE @ AregH | €1 fhar o W € |

3, R S B G H g N wie e a1 Fee @ oy s (1) @
e e JTERET T HR HHE B 99 g g1 Rl ST a1 Sy Wi A1 anT
P T GGG T B W BT AT WST B WS fFAT AT NPT S FhaT & | W, SR
ST |

4 Il e/ SEQRIT SO @GR H e Wi BR e FeiRa gred o
S PR AT e} fAdre @ T B q9T g AUREl & folg WReR A feHid 15.06.1999
AT TILAT 25.06.2002 DI HeNe b |

5.  3UN U4 31122018 BT AAHSH ¥ #EHSA & WAE TP A€ YA d & fy e
02.01.2019 BT §S 3T I8& ¥ YT BT ATANAT P AT o7 | 2019 S WS FA B IRM 13,
02.2019 T ST AT ¥ AU SR Wy /9o St ameyr (SR Heie) e,
2019 @ AT ¥ U fhar waT| qenf, fAdae e W § wRa T8 81 AP i 13.02.2019
B WS A GAC B gHT AT | FAFAY 1687 WA FHT BT GAIGA & AT AT 171 <rep AT A
¢ WHR BT TS 5T AT [I0gd B FHI A & gHT o7 | 3 W9 A fge B uiRka
H B AT AFed @& AR B AEWEHAT BRIl & | SN AT FRES Iod WRAR R
I ST @Y g § e B B Y ue iR SwITa 9RT @ "ETSiad Gl S
wmmﬁ%mﬁwﬁﬁﬁﬁwmﬁmmﬁmm
@Wﬁ%wamwﬁaﬁﬁﬁwzﬁwwmﬁw

2. 7% AW TM@/DR. Nand I‘umar Sai

T /Chairperson
U@ FREA sl S
National Commi for Schediled Tribes
I |7/ Gowt, of india .
=% B/ Naw Delhi




National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122" Meeting held on 11-12-2019

6. SRS YU B A STote @ gA H AeeE a9 @ forg wfder (gt
SI) 3T, 1950 § Weed & foy va fewol &7 w=a@ & St 39 Y&R &

1.

6.

HH W0 1 # ‘3@’ (Abor) @I ger WY @@ife w9 Ho 16 # ‘afe’ (Adi) U &
g |

%9 60 6 ¥ ‘@S (Khampti) @ 5o § @Y’ (Khamti) &1 uferenfia fear
TG |

#H o 8 ¥ ‘AR wre’ (Mishmi-Kaman) (9 =34 (Miju Mishmi), €3

(Idu) (Mishmi) 3R @ri= (Taraon) (R fawedh) (Digaru Mishmi) @1 &4
Jo 8 # wfaenfia  faar &Q |

%9 0 9 # AT (Momba) @ sger ‘AiFar (Monpa), w1 (Memba), R
(Sartang), ‘rsirarT (Sajolong) (fst) (Miji) @1 gfaenfa fear S |
STEUTES YR B IR ot @ gA # HH o 10 H B AW St
% gea # A’ (Nocte), ‘@irar (Tangsa), ‘gear (Tutsa), ‘@l (Wancho)
Bl yfereenfua f&ar Wy |

IO Yo B LA S @ G HH Wo 16 W AfeT (Yobin) @1
yfereenfud foar S |

7. =9 WA ¥, 98 Sooid fhar o € fb feHie 05.09.2018 AT 27.09.2019 I AN ERT
o 1069, 1078 T 1204 dob # 37 AT W TR & fIR AT S T & AT doh B

AR B S S w3 § ST @ g Policy/05/ 2018/MTA(AP)/RU-II fa=Tis 06.

112018 @7 TR UA® YT/1/2019/STGAR/DEINEX/ RU-II fa=ris 01.10.2019 & Hread
AT T FHT & |

(o @ ERM AMe W fawqa =af g2, T 7w w9l WAl < 7 aggar
SN & JATer @Y g s o1 fo forr )

o A .

3l 7 FAW "A@/DR. Nand Kumar Sai
=/ Chairperson
TS sggfEd S st
National Cemmission for Scheduled Tribes
I "W/ Govt. of India .
¢ fEswil/New Delhi



e
National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122" Meeting held on 11-12-2019

Agenda Draft note for Cabinet for revision of List of Scheduled Tribes (Sts) Notified
item No.- | under Article 342 of Constitution of India with respect to the State of
122.2 Arunachal Pradesh.

File No. Policy/05/2018/MTA(AP)/RU-11

Ministry of Tribal Affairs has forwarded a copy of O.M. No.12026/24/2012-C&LM-1
dated 31% October, 2019, received in the Commission enclosing with a copy of Draft Note for the
Cabinet dated October, 2019 on the above mentioned subject.

2. In this context, it is stated that the Constitution of India enjoins on the State a special
responsibility for the protection and development of Scheduled Tribes. Clause (25) of article 366
of the Constitution defines Scheduled Tribes as “ST means such tribes or tribal communities or
parts of or groups within such tribes or tribal community as are deemed under article 342 to be ST
for the purpose of this Constitution”. According to the above mention provisions, the first
specification of Scheduled Tribes in relation to a particular State or UT is by a notified Order of
President, after consultation with the Stage Govt. or UT concerned. Any subsequent inclusion in
or exclusion from and other modifications in list of ST can be made only through an amending
Act of Parliament.

3. Parliament may by law include in or exclude from the list of Scheduled Tribes specified in
a notification issued under clause (1) any tribe or tribal community or part of or group within any
tribe or tribal community, but save as aforesaid a notification issued under the said clause shall not
be varied by any subsequent notification.

4, The Government on 15.6.1999, and further amended on 25.6.2002, laid down modalities
for deciding claims for inclusion in, exclusion from and other modification in Order specifying
ST/ST lists.

5. Earlier, on 31.12.2018 a Note for the Cabinet was submitted to Cabinet and the Cabinet in
its meeting held on 02.01.2019 had approved the proposal. The Bill namely “The constitution
SC/ST Order (Third Amendment) Bill, 2019 was passed in Rajya Sabha on 13.02.2019 during
Parliament Session 2019. However the Bill could not be introduced in Lok abha as the Parliament
was concluded on 13.02.2019. Since the 16" Lok Sabha has been dissolved and new Government
has been formed in the 17" Lok Sabha and the Bill has been lapsed, So there is a requirement for
approval of the Cabinet for introduction of the Bill in the Parliament. In the meantime one more
proposals of the State Government of Jharkhand for inclusion in the list of ST of Jharkhand has
been concurred by both RGI and NCST which also needs to be taken up along with proposals

already included in the lapsed Bill.

¥, = AR FE/OR. Nand Kumar Sai
Furef/Chairperson
i el ST AET
Mational Commission for Scheduled Tribes
wa @vET/Govt. of India .
7% Rewi/New Delhi




National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122" Meeting held on 11-12-2019

5. The proposal in this note is to amend the Constitution (ST) Order 1950 by amending the
list of Scheduled Tribes of Arunachal Pradesh, as under:-

L

Deletion of ‘Abor’ in Serial No.1, as it is the same as ‘Adi’ in Serial No.16.

2. Replace ‘Tai Khamti’ instead of ‘Khampti’ at Serial No.6.

3. Inclusion of ‘Mishmi-Kaman’ (Miju Mishmi), Idu (Mishmi) and Taraon (Digaru
Mishmi) in Serial No.8.

4. Inclusion of Monpa, Memba, Sartang, Sajolang (Miji) in Serial No.9 in lieu of
‘Momba’.

5. Inclusion of ‘Nocte’, ‘Tangsa’, ‘Tutsa’, ‘Wancho’ in lieu of ‘Any Naga Tribes’ in
Serial No.10 in list of ST of Arunachal Pradesh.

6. Inclusion of ‘Yobin’ at serial No.16 in list of Scheduled Tribes of Arunachal Pradesh.

6. In the instant case, it is mentioned that these matters has already been considered in the

Commission’s in its 106% , 107" and 120" meeting dated 05.09.2018 and 27.9.2019 and the
extract of the proceedings meeting (s) were sent to the Ministry of Tribal Affairs vide
Commission’s letter No. Policy/05/2018/MTA(AP)/RU-II dated 06.11.2018 and another letter
No.YT/1/2019/STGAR/DEINEX/RU-II dated 01.10.2019.

(The matter was discussed in detail, The Commission has approved the proposal and
decided to apprise the Ministry of Tribal Affairs accordingly.)

§ g S

31, 7 FAX AA™/DR. Nand Kumar Sai
e/ Chairperson
TS AR aeme dE
National Commission for Scheduled Tribes

| "I/ Govt, of India
£ Rei/New Dsihi




National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122" Meeting held on 11-12-2019

B G | |IGE (@ ST 3T 1950 B WENE BT IRd—3NSe II5F B
He Ho wHee A
122.3

wigel o Policy/9/2019/MoTA(C &LM)/RU-III

TAGTET SR HATEd N faHie 28.01.2019 B UF WO 12026 /44 /2013—H TS VAUH B
g e & SRR SHfaar @ GA § %9 9. 31 W Py (Kandha) WHE™ & SU—9E
& ®U § ‘Fu—gAR (Kandha Kumbhar) ¥He@ @& w9 # ¥HEEH &R 3R HH W 53 TR
WXid (Oraon) & FARIT S=M /3R (Uram/Oraon), Sid /girel’ (Oraon/Dhangra) @em
Wig G (Oraon Mudi) & FHIARE @R @& Hae H Ioe dfde Are @1 Ueb ufd dofl g |
ST BT JATeTd A IS SR ST AN BT U fewol s g SR fohar
2| I8 yad HGTAl BT FHIYH FRA $ o S (SR Sionfa) sre, 1950 H AR
ENICERCEE i

() 7 o 31 W ‘T (Kandha) IR SO & I & WY A PY HAR
(Kandha Kumbhar)

(i) onf¥em & srqqfyd Seonfodl @ W ¥ HH Wo 53 WX gaee AR@ (Oraon) &
FarEmet S /3RM (Uram/Oram), Sxid /eamreTr (Oraon/ Dhangara) @=m ‘3iRi@ qer
(Oraon Mudi)

NfEe ToT Y SR STl @ g H BH W0 31 W T WS D SU-AE D
¥ FY—HIR WS BT FAREH B Y 9T TSR & UKIE BT ARG FEEl & AR
IRA B HETUSIAD (IRONSATE) TAT LT Iqfaa Solif AT gRT A forgn 3 g |

afeen T A YT Aol @ {E A HA W0 53 WX SNId B AR
INM / 3R, $71a / airet (Uram/Oram, Uraon/Dhangara) @ aiki@ gt (Oraon Mudi)
BT FHNIE XA B UKAG DY RN B 1118} I5F H AT ST SToMfel AT §RT AN
forar T W YR B RGNS (JRONEE) 7 iR & wHERfl dae S3ig (Oraon) @
A & g 37O el & © |

@od F STy S JAe @y W e e fHar T e A e w®

3o A € 1)
i .

2l ¥ AR HE/OR. Nand Kumar Sai
Fa@E/Chairperson
U SrERE S ST
National Commission for Scheduled Tribes

e §vEt/ Govt. of India .
=% f=h/New Delhl




e

National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122t Meeting held on 11-12-2019

Agenda item Proposal to amend the Constitution (Scheduled Tribes) Order, 1950 -
No.- 122.3 with respect to the State of Odisha.

File no. - Policy/9/2019/MoTA(C&LM)/RU-III

The Ministry of Tribal Affairs vide letter no. 12026/44/2013-C&LM dated 28/01/2019 has
forwarded a copy of Draft Note for the Cabinet regarding inclusion of 'Kandha Kumbhar'
community as a sub-set of 'Kandha' community at SI. No. 31 and inclusion of 'Uram/Oram’ ,
Uraon/Dhangara and 'Oraon Mudi' communities as synonyms of Oraon at Sl. No. 53 in the list of
STs of Odisha. The MoTA has requested to NCST to send their comments.

The proposal is for amend the Constitution (Scheduled Tribe) Order, 1950 for inclusion of
communities, namely

(i) 'Kandha Kumbhar' community as a subset of 'Kandha' Scheduled Tribe at  serial
number 31 and

(ii) "Uram/Oram, Uraon/Dhangara and 'Oraon Mudi' communities as synonyms of 'Oraon’
listed at serial number 53 in the list of Scheduled Tribes of Odisha.

The proposal of State Government for inclusion of 'Kandha Kumbhar' community as a
sub-set of 'Kandha' community at SI. No. 31 in the list of Scheduled Tribes of the State of Odisha
has been concurred by RGI and NCST as per approved modalities.

The proposal for inclusion of 'Uram/Oram', 'Uraon/Dhangara’ and 'Oraon Mudi'
communities as synonyms of Oraon at Sl. No. 53 in the list of Scheduled Tribes of the State of
Odisha has been concurred by NCST in 111th Meeting of the Commission but RGI has only
concurred for inclusion of 'Uraon' as synonym of 'Oraon’.

(The proposal of the Ministry of Tribal Affairs was considered in detail in the

meeting, the Commission has approved the proposal.)

2 A T HM/DR. Nand Kumar Saj
: HER/Chairperson
TS Sggfm s mfy sty
National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
WA "1/ Govt. of India
7§ RH/New Delhi

11




National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122t Meeting held on 11-12-2019

SR A | BTG Xod © 6eY § ARG @ WIAU ® 1908 342 B Ieid gL
g W0 Igfaa S (T B g BT e |

1224

wigel |o Policy/8/2019/MoTA(C&LM)/RU-III

TG S HATerd A fRATE 31102019 B UF FO 12026 /91 ,/2015—% UUS UAUH(12251)
R BT WS B Wey H ARd @ WAUE & oITee 342 @ 3w AT ¥
SR (TEe) @ g # Weed e & Hayg # gioe Bfave Jie $ e gl Aol § |

T8 ywarg freferRad |@aTaeET o7 g9l Bye @ fory oxiNgTe Wsg & ey # HAfauH
(ST SIToTITer) MIReT, 1950 & WeIEN & forg woe & fagRss U9 & & forg & -

() @9 %o 5 wx Wikar {f|m  (Bharia Bhumia) @& wwmmit «gar (Bhuinya), 4z
(Bhuiyan), s (Bhuyan)

(i) =¥ ¥0 14 W y9ar (Dhanwar) @& waERT g98R /g9arR (Dhanuhar/Dhanuwar)
(i) =" o 32 W TR (Nagesia), ArmiRraT (Nagasia) @ wAMMR f&am (Kisan)

(v) " Wo 41 W Wax  (Sawar), Wawr  (Sawara) @ |AMERT | (Saunra), HaT
(Saonra)

(v) o @ e gfeRenfid SR gU B o 33 W SIRRIfH fEEl wuieRer A guR
(vi) @5 ¥o 43 R fdfsmn  (Binjhia)

(Vi) ¥ W0 27 W BISIq B I TANN BUCRY & ©I H Dred, @ AA—HY DI,
(viii) ¥ Ho 23 R D (Kondh) & F—HF ®ig (Kond)

(iX) | Ho 5 WX WIRAT 99 $ 3o wuiawer § a1 uRad+ fey gu wRar & w9 H
HRAT BT GeR

(x) 9 W0 5 W U, Uvel/Uws!

(xi) " Ho 16 X T TqAT TS

3l 7 R FW/DR. Nand Kumar Sai
F@H/Chairperson
TS SgRE S s
National Commussion for Sci eduled Tribes
HRA HTER/Gowvt. of India .
=& Ref/New Delhi

12




TR A

National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122" Meeting held on 11-12-2019

(xii)  orIfAe SieToTiy @Y G F wH Wo 15 WX SUSH wureRer ¥ a7 ufRacd fpy gy e

UL SRR SN AN W W R U T uE @ gRT SRIET Jwdd P
Tgel €1 Wl T o | SWIed YRTg Bt yHdl o & forg faemh T & e iRt avd
g0 < (IR STt e (W) R, 2019 (V) @ AW W TS fSE
TR far T B |

(T R R @ b e B 976, AN 3 g0 dfde die # SeeifEd wwda B wHeie
faram)

1

2l. FX FAR FW/DR. Nand Kumar Sai
HE/Chairperson
U sgyfaa ety s
National Commission for Scheduled Tribes

g |@vE/ Govt. of India .
7€ Reit/New Delhi



National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122" Meeting held on 11-12-2019

Agenda item Revision of List of Scheduled Tribe (STs) notified under Article 342 of
No.- 122.4 Constitution of India with respect to the State of Chhattisgarh.

File no. - Policy/8/2019/MoTA(C&LM)/RU-III

The Ministry of Tribal Affairs vide letter no. 12026/91/2015-C&LM(12251) dated 31/10/2019 has
forwarded the copy of Draft Note for the Cabinet regarding revision of list of Scheduled Tribe
(STs) notified under Article 342 of Constitution of India with respect to the State of Chhattisgarh.

The proposal is for introduction of a Bill in Parliament to amend the Constitution (Scheduled
Tribe) Order 1950 with respect to the State of Chhattisgarh to give effect the following inclusions:

(i) Bhuinya (Hi{‘q'l’), Bhuiyan ('Jﬁtﬁ), Bhuyan(4dT) as synonyms of Bharia Bhumia (vt @’QT)

at entry No.5

(ii) Dhanuhar/Dhanuwar(Y4J8R/UJdRR) as synonyms of Dhanwar(Y-dIX) at entry No.14
(iii) Kisan (mﬂ) as synonym ofNagesia(:lﬂﬁl'qD, Nagasia(:‘I'PTﬁR:I'D at entry No. 32

(iv) Saunra @'T[), Saonra(¥dR0) as synonyms of Sawar(HTAR), Sawara(FdXT) at entry No.41
(v) Rectification of " in Hindi version notified at entry No.33 by substitution with YTS!
(vi) 'Binjhia(%‘%lm)' at entry No.43

(vii) 39;1—6"@ along with W@ as a variant Devanagari version of Kodaku at entry No. 27
(viii) Pig (Kond) along with Kondh (ﬁ‘ﬂ) at entry No.23

(ix) Correction of HTRAT as URAT without changing its English version name Bharia at entry No.5
(%) EE]| ,tl'UE’-T/EI%)[ at entry No.5

(xi) TS and T8 at entry No. 16

(xii) TTGET at entry No. 15 in ST list without change in English text

NCST had already supported the above proposals vide letters issued on number of occasions.

To give effect to the proposals contained above, a Bill namely, "The Constitution (Scheduled
Tribes) Orders (Amendment) Bill, 2019 (Annexure-V) has been prepared in consultation with the
Legislative Department.

(After detailed discussion, the Commission supports the proposal mentioned in the

draft Cabinet Note.)

21, 7= FAR §A/DR. Nand Kumar Sai
14 are/Chairperson -
e srgEfE S A
Mational Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Ra g7/ Govt. of India
=% R=fi/New Delhi



National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122" Meeting held on 11-12-2019

P G | T ToT IR SOl WEdR A (HYe) STEaTeT, 2019 @ WeE H|
AY W0
1225

wisa €o Policy/6/2019/MHA(J&PP Section)/RU-I1I

ST B " N fRAiE 25.10.2019 @ UH [0 20025 /44 /2019— UAAIGHC] &
ERT SRIG 98 R I8 7309 B AT F99 W60 14 /06 /2019— JudI&PP fRFTd araeeR,
2019 U frar € don IS SR SIS TN B $6 "IN UR STPR] Sl BRa
BT IR 5T B |

Hou YR SN ST WEeR faftren (WeiE) sraey # WueE B ged A9
fafefad &—

(1)  oxT4 ¥ SR (1) ¥ TS (@) F T g B SR UE g9RC wes B aforenfud
o SmoT |

) 7w (1) B R (1) § R Su-we SRR B, R AT 2

(i) oY WRPHR ERT THI—90 IR AT o T R ¥ IfF ko X W, fbar
A ROTSTAT Bl DI AT Hal [Tl SIeT |

(i) Y gRT (2) B TSHAT A |

(i) B9 uxr 3) # SU °R1 (2) B fFTa FAURT fFy W IR A RS B T
"I YR Ieg B wfoetia far g |

@) WS 24 F—() "o HEMT @ WE ] gY e yioRemua fdear Sgm qen (i) Us
EOR” BT S8 U g ¥res BT gfoenfid fasar S |

(4) ORI 24 & qre, FEfAReT Wl @ siqwifa frar Srm— 24— 37 faferasi &1 awr
3 & I ogad  wre fhy faer B Fevemar gy B @ O & forg @ 99 W
ST AT TS fehet 3R SRadT BN 99T 39 ARE & U1 SiR &S & oy B
@ et MY e # B S FEaE W T8 8 |

(5) oRT 25 ®, SU URT () § “UP BN U@ A e B oY U=AI BOR wree g

155 Lol

e FAR ¥E/DR. Nand Kumar Sai
a‘ﬁr&ﬂ?hairperson

: TS eEfE TR e

National Commission for Scheduled Tribes

WIXd 6/ Govt. of India .
4 Resii/New Delhi




National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122 Meeting held on 11-12-2019

IE ARV ST B AR STl B Ut H BRI SR I5g A FUrRTerel W Sl
&M PRAT 59 AT HT A& BT |

e R R ¥ 9af & @ 918, A[EET ¥ TIE W AU geAfa o @difs I8
FRAYRY XS B YR Seenodl & 2 21)

-t €5

2. T I g
: N

TRy o i

National Comms on for Se

T MY Govt, ui ndia
/New Delhj




National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122" Meeting held on 11-12-2019

Agenda item The Madhya Pradesh Anusuchit Janjati Sahukar Viniyam
No.- 122.5 (Sanshodhan) Adhyadesh, 2019-reg .

File no. - Policy/6/2019/MHA (J&PP Section)/RU-III

The Ministry of Tribal Affairs vide letter no. 20025/44/2019-NCST dated 25/10/2019 has
forwarded Ministry of Home Affairs OM No 14/06//2019-Judl &PP dated October, 2019 on the
above mentioned subject and requested to NCST provide inputs on this matter.

Following are the highlights of amendments in Madhya Pradesh Anusuchit Janjati Sahukar
Viniyam (Sanshodhan) Adhyadesh :-

(1) In section 4, in sub section (1), in clause (b) for the words "twenty -five" the words "five
thousand" shall be substituted.

(2) In section 7, (1) for sub section (1) the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:-

(i) No money lender shall charge, on any loan advanced, interest at a rate higher than that notified
by the State Government from time to time.

(ii) sub- section (2) shall be omitted.

(iii) in sub-section (3), for the words "charge in excess of that prescribed under sub-section (2), the
words "other charges" shall be substituted.

(3) In section 24,- (i) for the words "six months", the words "two years" shall be substituted, and
(ii) for the words "one thousand", the words " one lakh" shall be substituted.

(4) After section 24, the following section shall be inserted, namely:-

24A - Any loan advanced or interest charged thereon by a money lender without obtaining a license
under Section 3 of these Regulations shall be infructuous and irrecoverable and no legal
proceedings shall be admissible in respect of such loan and interest in any court of law."

(5) In section 25, in sub-section (i) for the words " one thousand five hundred”, the words " twenty
five thousand" shall be substituted.

The ordinance seems to be in favour of Scheduled Tribes of the State and aims to protect them
from money lenders in the State.

(After detailed discussion, the Commission approved the proposal since it is for the benefit

of Scheduled Tribes of the State of Madhya Pradesh)

2l. % R HA/DR. Nand Kumar Sai
m/Chairparson.
” 1A gl sonfy s
15 , National Commission for Scheduled Tribes

I T017/ Govt. of India
=¥ Resi/New Delhi



National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122" Meeting held on 11-12-2019

W BNTTE @ AR Seferal @t g # T'Bhuyya, bhiyan'' wgerd &t i
N0 | g B yvag @ |ey H |
1226

FILE NO- INCLUSION/2017/MTA/RU-III

ST Bl #3Terd ¥ fedia 01.11.2019 @1 gF o -12026/11/2010C&LM-| gred
BT B | SO ST HATerd 1 BRITe Wog ®I A SITolle Yl § HH %0 5 WX dldg
' Bharia Bhumia' @ J#=meft @& w7 # "Bhuyya, Bhiyan" wgerdi @1 e & w®
T YA ST AT @l fewfordt AR 7 |

2013 ¥ TEARNY BRI FA R BUNTE & SR Soiia @) # 9iRar i
@ Wl @ w9 | Ui |geral )i) Bhuinya) i) Bhuiyan )iii) Bhuyan ) iv)Bhuyya )v)
Bhiyan @f Ifie &== & WXad &1 offg & 77 off | Vo9 WRBR & Fead ded & qr—drd
IUAE YHIRT AT & MER W SR BRI FAI 7 BTG D g STrofel i
# Bhuinya, Bhuiyan ik Bhuyan @1 Bharia Bhumia @ s @ wu # ugel diF wqgmal
B RS B @1 w5 B 1 gfe 9 9Ha il | Bls WEld YA SUde T8l 8%
off | I T TR WS AT 3R e 7 BT 1 AIgHfad STt gai § S a1
B9 B FAYH TE AT 39 I WRER F AT MR A B e e & wmeiA A ek
ey UK by 2|

ARA & ASTUGIId BT AT, BURTIE B (e ool @ & § qgar 3R
fa @1 Bharia, Bhumia @ smmmeft & w9 # wfid ox7 & g &1 waefd oxl €|

(R & =t &7 @ 918, BINTE & gfad Sitoriadl @ ! d wiikar (Bharia),
qffar (Bhumia) @ wafa & w9 § qrar 7o B39 (Bhuyya, Bhiyan) ¥5@ &1 i
B @ Ry S o & w3erd @ wvarg @1, ST wHeie &ear 2 1)

o

#f. 7= FHI FA/DR. Nand Kumar Sz
smE/Chairperson .
i ST S AT
National Commussion for Scheduled Tr::
wE w7Ed/Govt. of India -
=% fawei/New Delhi




National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122t Meeting held on 11-12-2019

Agenda item Proposal for inclusion of "Bhuyya, Bhiyan'" community in the
No.- 122.6 Scheduled Tribes list of Chhattisgarh-reg.
FILE NO- INCLUSION/2017/MTA/RU-III

The ministry of Tribal affairs vide letter no. 12026/11/2010-C&LM-I dated 01/11/2019
has received. MoTA seeking comments of NCST on inclusion of "Bhuyya, Bhiyan" communities
as synonyms of 'Bharia Bhumia' listed at SI.No. 5 in the Scheduled Tribes list of Chhattisgarh.

In 2013 the proposal for inclusion of five communities viz. (i) Bhuinya (ii) Bhuiyan (iii)
Bhuyan (iv) Bhuyya (v) Bhiyan as synonyms of Bharia Bhumia in the Scheduled Tribes list of the
Chhattisgarh was examined by the MoTA. Based on the available published information as well
supporting evidences of the State Government. MoTA supported the inclusion of first three
communities namely Bhuinya, Bhuiyan and Bhuyan as synonyms of Bharia Bhumia in the STs
list of Chhattisgarh. As there was no supporting informaion readily available at that time. The
remaining two proposed communities i.¢ Bhuyya and Bhiyan not supported their inclusion in the
STs list of Chhattisgarh. Now the State Government has furnished further evidences in support for
inclusion of Bhuyya and Bhiyan.

The ORGI supports the proposal for inclusion of Bhuyya and Bhiyan as synonyms of
Bharia, Bhumia in the list of Scheduled Tribes of Chhattisgarh.

(After detailed discussion, the Commission supports the proposal of the Ministry of
Tribal Affairs for inclusion of Bhuyya and Bhiyan community as synonyms of Bharia,
Bhumia in the list of STs of Chhattisgarh.)

g

2t, 9% FI "A/DOR. Nand Kumar Sai
e/ Chairperson
i sl ST ST :
National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
qr=it/Govt. of India

& Rewi/New Delhi




National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122" Meeting held on 11-12-2019

o G | aifer & eEa SRl @ gd #§ U KUL TR B Wi 3 B
HO | yere @ e |
122.7

FILE NO- INCLUSION/2017/MTA/RU-III

ST BT T3 ¥ fRAT® 05112019 @ T Ho -12026/29/2012C&LM-| greg

o ¥ | wafen =mate A St @ g #° KULL "wer @1 i @ wee | fde
fou & | SFET BT 5O ¥ wate araerd @ Beel @ Ui, TRA @ "elduide 9 UK
SR STy SAnT W ey fewfrt ure Hen 8y Wl 4§ |

qRA @ AFER Gate ~marea a1 oty @ Ho 7362 /2019 ® wilRa gom & shfem
w7 ¥ 'KULIS' = & 318 ager =& 81 vears ' KUL " wera &1 afe g7 " KULL " 4

" KULIS " @1 enfirer ) ava &, o aifem aRum 98 @9 % &9 srgqfud Sieeita dl g
A TH SR Y BT S | S e, AFAIG e A7 W Tl @1 e A vEd gy
e B fafre qedt ek TRRRE @1 sEeiee fhar ik gamr & e fEr W@ sl

wweor & "KULIS "ores @1" KULl "wHer & e & wnfiel fhar Sy |

e 9 I WHR T eI B agad St @ g § "KULL "er wmfier

w1 B forg ST wed e @1 Ry o & wifs wgerd "KULIS" @1 uget & srgefera
ST @ g § A o 42 W e far S g 2

(o W g wet @ Suwid A 3 Jgifs w7 § TR AT o ST WRER
¥ ra 3oy @ oA U9 WRa @ ol g1 Wi urw #1)

T wr

3f. 5 FAX ¥A/DR. Nand Kumar Sai
a=@w/Chairperson .
TS FaT T ST
National Commission for Scheduled Ttibes
a7 gTEU/Govt. of India -
=% Refl/New Delhi



National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122" Meeting held on 11-12-2019

Agenda item Proposal for inclusion of '"Kuli"" community in the Scheduled Tribes
No.- 122.7 list of Odisha-reg.

FILE NO- INCLUSION/2017/MTA/RU-III

The ministry of Tribal affairs vide letter no.12026/29/2012-C&LM dated 05/1 1/2019 has
received. The Supreme Court has given directions in respect of inclusion of community "KULI"
in list of tribes. The MoTA has been forwarded the copy of judgment of the Supreme Court to RGI
and NCST to obtaining their comments.

Judgment of Hon'ble Supreme Court of India passed in CA No. 7362/2013 that 'there is no
community by the name "KULIS" in the State of Odisha. The only Community is "KULI". If we
don't include "KULI" in "KULIS", the net result would be that we would be deleting a tribe from
the list of Scheduled Tribes. Further, Hon'ble Court also observed that "Taking all the above facts
into consideration, in the peculiar facts and circumstances of the case, we are of the view that the
term "KULIs" in the English version will be include members of the "KULI" community.

State Government of Odisha has requested to take appropriate steps to include "KULI" in
the ST list of Odisha as the community "KULIS" has already been included at SI. No. 42 of ST
list of Odisha.

(The matter was discussed in detail, the Commission has supported the proposal in
principal, subject to justification received from the Government of Odisha and supported by
the Registrar General of India.)

LT

Kumar Sai
2, T g A/DR. Nand K

a;a_m.ﬂchairpemon z
o gl S

‘ n for Scheduled Tribes
National Ccmmissmecm- igreced

& meR/New Dethi



National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122" Meeting held on 11-12-2019

P O | IRGS U ® GaY § ARG B ATDT 342 D Savia AOgLd, JFHAT ST
g2 o | (TE)) @ g H HeeE &1 |
122.8

File no. - Policy/7/2019/MoTA(C&LM)/RU-III

ST B #AE ¥ faie 31.102019 @ 9= "o — 12026/05/2015C&LM &R
TRES T B ey F 9IRGB WU B Y 342 B ofia iRy argqfE St
(qerd)) 2 T F R B B Fey F goe dfae A B vd ufd wol 2|

Tz yg FrEfeRed GaReE @ TS B B oy wRGs T & day A |fder

(eI SfeY) mere, 1950 Ud WA (STgfe STi) ST, 1950 @ WIMEA & folg dde
¥ fagas I v @ fY B

(1) i Sfd @ S & %9 Wo 3 X FAIgg {1l e $ ™l WY 3R
2) orEfia SRl @ g § Frefafed wert B e wv @ fag-
() =2 wfafie & w9 § g )puran); e

(i) w9 Wo 16 W YHEE Kharwar (@aR) @& @il & w7 # Bhogta
(¥r7e), Deshwari (2¥@RY), Ganjhu (%)), Dautalbandi (Dwalbandi)
(@ead)) (gTed)), Patbandi (Feal) Raut (R1Sd), Maajhia (Arfzmn)
Khairi @) (Kheri) (&)

(i) % o 24 ¥ 'Munda' (§e1) & wARIl @ w9 # Tamaria/Tamadia
(awfRar /qwfean) |

RS Y ERPR BT T/ RIeRe, IRGS B IR STenel @ 1 7 SuRa
Wﬁ%ﬁ%ﬁw%mﬁwmmwmmﬁm
¥ A ® A Aol DI TS © |

R ST SR ST N HHA—FH TR S Ry Y gEl @ gy S SR
T Eer B wHl T °T | SIRIGT FTE B YA B @ forg ey v @ ey wwee
PRI gY AR (R St e (W) faggd, 2019 (rgeE-V) 3 A ¥ 0D
fadrre AR far T 2 |

(AR @ 74t T D q0E, AN A SE B HAGd B TRIG BT FHAT DA

i e L

=% AT HAE/DR. Nand ¥umar Sal
 yrem/Chairpers
e : t
tanal Commission for S £ DD

T/

22 = E



National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122" Meeting held on 11-12-2019

Agenda item Revision of List of Scheduled Tribe (STs) notified under Article 342 of
No.- 122.8 Constitution of India with respect to the State of Jharkhand.

File no. - Policy/7/2019/MoTA(C&LM)/RU-III

The Ministry of Tribal Affairs vide letter no. 12026/05/2015-C&LM dated 31/10/2019 has
forwarded the copy of Draft Note for the Cabinet regarding revision of list of Scheduled Tribe
(STs) notified under Article 342 of Constitution of India with respect to the State of Jharkhand.

The proposal is for introduction of a Bill in Parliament to amend the Constitution
(Scheduled Cast) order 1950+ and the Constitution (Scheduled Tribe) Order 1950 with respect to
the State of Jharkhand to give effect the following:

(1) to omit Bhogta community listed at serial No. 3 in the list of Scheduled Castes and

(2) to include the following communities in the list of Scheduled Tribes:-
(i) Puran (9T) as new entry; and

(i)  Bhogta  (HIT@l),  Deshwari  (G¥ERD),  Ganjhu(TE]),  Dautalbandi
(Dwalbandi)[GIAASalgIeal(],  Patbandi(Ues=<),  Raut(IId),  Maajhia(HITRF),

Khairi(Kheri)[@ﬁ)@ﬁ(] as synonyms of Kharwar (GXdR) entry at S.N. 16

(iii) Tamaria/Tamadia (Fljzlﬁtﬂfﬂ'q%?:ﬂ) as synonym of'Munda'(%D at S.No.24

The proposal/recommendation of State Govt. of Jharkhand, concurrence of RGI and
NCST for inclusion of above mentioned community in list of Scheduled Tribe list of Jharkhand
has been enclosed with the draft note.

To give effect to the proposals contained above, a Bill namely, "The Constitution
(Scheduled Castes and Scheduled Tribes) Orders (Amendment) Bill, 2019 has been prepared in
consultation with the Legislative Department.

(After detailed discussion, the Commission supports the proposal of the Ministry.)

T

2, T8 g T@/DR. Nand Kumar sai
’ Wn‘chairperson e
e FgErEE o Eleil

i - o for Scheduled Tribes
National CommnssnonGOVt el

& Rt/ New Deihi

el



National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122" Meeting held on 11-12-2019

B g WW%WWWWW%W%WI?%%%
7e wo 9 | affrm o ¥ weler—orgafe Snfdl 3R N Sontudl @ fg wmeer <
g Qe |

w1ger %o (Policy/AP/2019/RU-1V)

Yy UT WRAR Y ST Sfadl qen Sl @ ey afefEs o 9./2003 g
o W91 XT9Y AT BT Gor feban & | ifdfrEE wo 9,/2003 H WY @ e AT fA g
%WWWWWW%WWW@?&@WW
a%w,mﬁ—maawﬁwﬁﬁ@@aaﬂﬁfﬁﬁmmfﬁﬁmaﬁﬁaaﬁﬁam
Wﬁﬁﬂmﬁﬁﬁmmaﬁmﬁwwwuﬁamwﬁﬁwwﬁﬁm
TRETOT IR 1955 GUT ST FARTT SfTATH 1989 & TET WRETOT & TEA AT S
T ST @ fore erdva fafi= wxerll den ArRe feRi & g Sl &1 qeaiad &
& BT BT £ g 2011 SNTVMAT B SR MY UL SRR SIS @ Bl AT 59.18
W?ﬁ%@%ﬁﬁs.ggmélmaﬁ%ﬁmﬁﬁﬁﬁﬁwa@m
& W § FE PR @ A et & g Geaiee @ g qur SR Siiadl
ol qor IRERT @ THET & TEd FRTEIT B AT B FHeT S qEd Sraragy B A B
e T BTt @ Sl et @ TRUTREaY RIGIRET GaR B SR ARG St
3 weroT STRRITE, 1955 @ TEC WaTe QRN B Yac T SRR S TUT ST (SFerER
foramor) arferfam, 1955 T 3eT YT SR & A ERACKROT Il 1959 T 3 BT
vd Prmraferdl SR f ROFR @1 SI 5 GHa—awg IR e foam T, o 31 I AR
aﬁamﬁﬁﬁmﬁwmmwmﬁaﬁﬁmﬁwmwﬁ@ﬂw
ATANT BT B FAET AEA & Rradr ToT 2003 B ARYH 9 & T fAr T |

aﬂ%ﬁmﬂmﬁaﬁzﬁﬁquwmma%mﬁmﬁﬁwﬁaﬁw
12 /12 /2019 B AR g5 3T YT S e aRug @ dod o WHET Y@l Tl o
o IRYE IO Fped WA 3§ FEfiRad dewl B AR W Yud A I<R SRy
SSITY ATART & GO @ fog wdaAfT § Iwre e @R fedr 8-

1. aregeT
2. I
3. =7 & Rl § 4 $9 A 9 S Aa Algell BT |

WWWWWWW@WWWWW?HW
Wwwmmqﬁﬁaﬁﬁwﬁamﬁ%ﬂﬁw%m%%%mgtﬁ

& YIS I AT & |
e, g

3t 5% FAX WA/OR. Nand Kumar Sai
e /Chairperson .
TS S S S
National Commission for Scheduled Tribes

T §IE/ Govt. of India -

- =% Rwi/New Delhi



National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122" Meeting held on 11-12-2019

W%W%W&WWWH%@?WHWW&WWWUWW?
mw%wﬁmﬁmw%lﬁmmwwmméﬁww
HR FHAT € |

(WW%WWMWWWW%WWWW
szﬁﬁvfaﬁwwaﬁmﬁmmo

S

2f, 9% FAT J@/0R. Nand Kumar Sai
e/ Chairperson
e rgafER S S
National Commussion for Scheduled Tribes
W aeEy/Govt. of India
w§ Rwi/New Delhi




T A

National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122" Meeting held on 11-12-2019

AGENDA ITEM No. 9 | AMENDMENT TO ACT 9 OF 2003 REGARDING THE

CONSTITUTION OF ANDHRA PRADESH STATE
COMMISSION FOR SCHEDULED TRIBES -
CONSTITUTION OF TWO SEPARATE COMMISSIONS FOR
SCS & STS RESPECTIVELY

5 |

(Policy/AP/2019/RU-IV)

o S;ShzyG:;nglzr;;g; ?nc_irht:a Pradesh has created AP State Commission for SCs
- " The Act No. 9/2003 has provided for the Commission for
SCs and STs to perform functions related to enquiry, investigating and monitoring of
matters relating to the safeguard provided for the SCs and STs under Constitution or
under any Law and also evaluate the working of various safeguards and civil rights
accruing to SCs and /STs under protection of Civil Rights Act, 1955 and protecting to
Atrocity Act, 1989. The Scheduled Tribe population in Andhra Pradesh is 59.18 Lakhs as
per 2011 Census constituting 6.99% to the total population of the State. Therefore for
effective evaluation of working of various safeguards and to protect rights and interests
of Scheduled Tribes and to undertake a review of rights and interests of Scheduled Tribes
and to undertake a review of implementation of the policies and to make
recommendations with a view to ensue effective implementation and enforcement of alt
safeguards under Protection of Civil Rights Act, 1955 and the Scheduled Castes and the
Scheduled Tribes (Prevention of Atrocities) Act, 1989, the Andhra Pradesh Scheduled
Areas Land Transfer Regulation 1959 as amended from time to time and other laws and
the rules like ROFR, the Government of Andhra Pradesh proposes t0 enact an exclusive
State Commission for Scheduled Tribes by suitably amending the existing A.P. State
Commission for SC & ST which was constituted under Act 9 of 2003.
The issue pertaining to constituting 2 separate State Commission for STs was

placed pefore the A.P. Tribes Advisory Council in the meeting held on 12.12.2019 and

the Council unanimously resolved for creation of separate A.P. ST Commission through
their resolution No. 3 with members as follows.

1. Chairman,

2. Vice Chairman
3. Three members of these at least one shall be a woman member.

The Government of Andhra Pradesh requested the NCST to Concur the proposal

and convey the views on the above proposal as required under clause 9 of the Article

338-A of the Constitution of India. i _gV

2f. 5% FAW TA/DR. Nand Kumar Sai
ar=E/Chairperson
Namnﬁ\t{ srggfed S ST
T jonal Commission for Scheduled Tri
: uled Tribes
26 A Y/ Govt. of India -
= R=fi/New Delni

e




National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122" Meeting held on 11-12-2019

As the proposal of the State Government is in line with the safeguards and
protection provided to the Scheduled Tribes under the Constitution. Therefore, the

Commission may consider to concur the proposal.

(The Commission considered the proposal of the State Government of
Andhra Pradesh and agreed with the proposal. Accordingly, the decision of the
Commission may be conveyed to the State Government.)

o i i gl

2. 7= HAIOR. Nand Kumar =4
’ -ﬂmﬂChmrparson 1
@q Gﬂﬂfﬂﬁ s 0:h:lmzirftx"t)e)s
f on for Schedule i
National Commisst g e

(;g Frechi/New Delhi

-




National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122" Meeting held on 11-12-2019

Agenda Item: | Strengthening of Units at NCST Headquarter and Regional Offices by

10 providing minimal manpower for effective function as per the mandate
of NCST.

Since its creation vide Constitution (89" Amendment) Act, 2003, National Commission
for Scheduled Tribes is facing shortage of officers and staff and due to retirement of the officers
and officials over the years, the situation has further worsened. NCST is finding it difficult to
function effectively as per the mandate given in the Constitution of India. At present, out of
sanctioned strength of 124, only 50 regular officers and officials are working in NCST headquarter
and its six Regional offices. A large number of posts are vacant due to the reason that the cadre
controlling authority of these posts were Department of Social Justice and Empowerment and
National Commission for Scheduled Castes and these powers have been transferred to NCST a
few months ago. The Recruitment Rules of most of the posts are being framed for filling them on
regular basis which may take some time. Till then the work of the Commission should not suffer
and necessary arrangement have to be made.

It has been seen that the Units in the Commission headquarter are manned with one AD/RO
with multiple responsibilities and they are assisted by 01 Consultant/Sr. Investigator and 01 Data
Entry Operator. This is highly inadequate to tackle the heavy work load of grievances and sittings
in the Units and it is felt that examination of the replies received from the respondents needs to be
improved by engaging specialist Consultants having knowledge on the subject particularly land
matters, atrocities, constitutional provisions for Scheduled Tribes, reservation in posts and
services, displacement and resettlement of tribals etc. Similarly, almost all the Regional Offices
are presently headed by AD/RO level officers without any Sr. Investigator, Investigator or
Consultant. In some Regional offices like Raipur and Shillong, there is nobody to even type the
letters to initiate action on the grievances.

In view of the above, it is proposed to provide at least 01 or 02 Specialist Consultants in
the Units of Commission headquarter (depending on work load) and its six Regional Offices. It is
also proposed to provide 01 or 02 DEOs and Attendants (by way of out sourcing) to all the Units
of Headquarter and the Regional Offices after assessment of work load.

(After detailed discussion, the Commission strongly supported the proposal and
observed that to improve the grievance redressal mechanisim and performance, it is
necessary that all the units of headquarter and Regional Offices may be provided essential
man power after following the due procedure and taking necessary approvals.)

P nt

2, 7= g A /DR, Nand Kumar Sai
: arem/Chairperson o
4 b ﬁlﬁm &.1 d Tribes
s Ccommission for Schedui®
. C;Cg?‘k':-.r"?f:%ovt. of India

B i faeeh/New Delni




National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122" Meeting held on 11-12-2019

Agenda Item: Regularisation of four MTS in NCST as per the Order of Hon’ble
11 High Court of Delhi-reg.

FILE NO- 9/2/NCST/2017-Estt

The matter of regularization of services of four MTS employed in NCST headquarter and
regional office, Ranchi in compliance of Hon’ble High Court, Delhi was discussed as an agenda
item in the meeting. It was informed that In WP (C) NO.7937/2017& CM APPLN. 32765/2017
Judgement pronounced on 08" Jan, 2019 by Hon’ble Mr. Justice Suresh Kumar Kait in para 7 on
page -6 as under:

“7. Learned counsel submits that the petitioners have completed more than 11 years of
service. Therefore, they are entitled for regularisation as per para 444 & 53 of the judgement of
Hon’ble Supreme Court in State of Karnataka and Ors. vs. Uma Devi and Ors.2006 SCC (L&S)
7587,

Further, LPA220/2019 & CAV. 329/2019 & CM APPL.14676-78/2019 NCST
(Appellants) Versus Jitendra Kumar & ORS (Respondents) in the Hon’ble High Court in Delhi.
Hon’ble The Chief Justice and Hon’ble Mr. Anup Jairam Bhambhani passed Order on
01.04.2019 as under:

“The appeal is disposed of with a direction to the appellants to reinstate the respondents,
continue them as MTS, allow them to work on ad-hoc basis till their cases for regularisation are
considered in accordance to the law laid down in the case of State of Karnataka and Ors. vs. Uma
Devi and Ors.2006 SCC (L&S)753™.

NCST as per the direction of Hon’ble High Court, Hon’ble Mr. Justice Najmi Waziri
(Order dated 01.04.2019) reinstated the petitioners as MTS on an ad-hoc basis vide order No.
9/2/NCST/2017-Estt. dated 08.04.2019 which includes Shri Jitendra Kumar (UR), Shri Pankaj
(UR), Shri Sushil Kumar (SC) and Shri Pannu Singh Munda (ST).

On 14.11.2019 CONT.CAS ( C) 213/2019 was heard in the Hon’ble High Court of Delhi
and in this case Hon’ble Mr. Justice A K Chawala passed the Order dated 14.11.2019 as under:

“Copy of the order dated 31.08.2017 that was set aside vide judgement dated 08.01.2019
does not surface on record. Let a copy therefore be filed by the petitioners by way of an affidavit

within two weeks. List on 23.03.2020”.

2. 7% IR FE/OR. Nend Kumar Sai
sramr/Chairperson
e SR S ardr

ibes
| Commussion for Scheduled Tri
29 Nahon:rﬂﬂ et/ Govt. of India

= fedi/New Delhi



National Commission for Scheduled Tribes
Minutes of the 122" Meeting held on 11-12-2019

Keeping in view the position explained above and MoTA’s observations communicated to
NCST vide letter No.120/02/2017-NCST dated 07.11.2019 MoTA was requested to inform the
NCST whether a reply will be prepared by MoTA and to be submitted on behalf of the Secretary,
MoTA or areply will be submitted by the NCST in implementation of the Order dated 30.05.2019
of Hon’ble High Court of Delhi for regularisation as per the law laid down in the case of “State
of Karnataka and Ors.vs. Uma Devi and Ors., 2006SCC (L&S)753”.

Legal Consultant in NCST examined the case and has given his views which are as follows
— Now the NCST is all set to comply the order dated 08.01.2019 in terms of their regularisation
with all consequential benefits like seniority, pay and allowances from the date of their
regularisation, in accordance with the law laid down in of State of Karnataka and Ors.vs. Uma
Devi and Ors., 2006SCC (L&S)753.

Accordingly the matter was placed before NCST as an agenda in the 122" meeting of
the Commission. The Commission after detailed deliberations, decided that NCST should
go ahead with regularization of services of above four MTS after following the due
procedure and necessary consultation with MoTA, being the administrative Ministry and

other Ministries/Departments, if required.

3t 7 FAT /DR, Nand Kumar Sal
oeri/Chairperson
T S3gfm S A
National Commission for Scheduled Tribes

I 993/ Govt. of India .
=% Rewit/New Deihi

30



